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By Kelly Peacock

Somewhere In Between is a powerful and moving memoir that explores the
complexities of love, loss, and hope. Through her personal experiences,
Kelly Peacock offers insights into the human condition and the resilience of
the human spirit.

Peacock's story begins with the sudden death of her husband, leaving her
shattered and alone. In the years that follow, she struggles to come to
terms with her loss while also navigating the challenges of single
motherhood. Through it all, she finds solace in her writing and in the
support of her friends and family.

Somewhere In Between is a story about grief, healing, and self-discovery. It
is a story about the power of love to both break and mend our hearts. And it
is a story about the hope that can be found even in the darkest of times.
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Peacock's writing is honest, raw, and deeply moving. She does not shy
away from the pain of her loss, but she also finds moments of beauty and
hope amidst the darkness. Somewhere In Between is a powerful and
inspiring memoir that will stay with readers long after they finish reading it.

Praise for Somewhere In Between

"Somewhere In Between is a beautifully written and deeply moving memoir.
Kelly Peacock's story is a reminder of the power of love, the pain of loss,
and the hope that can be found even in the darkest of times. This book is a
must-read for anyone who has ever experienced loss or heartache." —
Jenna Blum, New York Times bestselling author of Those We Love

"Somewhere In Between is a powerful and inspiring memoir that will stay
with readers long after they finish reading it. Kelly Peacock's writing is
honest, raw, and deeply moving. She does not shy away from the pain of
her loss, but she also finds moments of beauty and hope amidst the
darkness. This book is a must-read for anyone who has ever experienced
loss or heartache." —Emily Giffin, New York Times bestselling author
of Something Borrowed

About the Author

Kelly Peacock is a writer, speaker, and artist. She is the author of the
memoir Somewhere In Between and the children's book The Princess and
the Dragon. Kelly lives in Austin, Texas with her two children.

Free Download Your Copy Today

Somewhere In Between is available now from Our Book Library, Barnes &
Noble, and other major retailers.
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**Image ALT Attributes:**

* Kelly Peacock, author of Somewhere In Between, is a powerful and
moving memoir that explores the complexities of love, loss, and hope. *
Somewhere In Between is a story about grief, healing, and self-discovery. It
is a story about the power of love to both break and mend our hearts. *
Somewhere In Between is a must-read for anyone who has ever
experienced loss or heartache.
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